
June 2020
NEW YA Items Available at KTL

Check the box for the items you would like to request & complete the bottom portion of the form with your information.                                                                                           
We will contact you when your items are ready for pickup.

YA ITEMS

YA 
FICTION 
ACE

Acevedo, 
Elizabeth, Clap When You Land 

Camino Rios lives for the summers when her 
father visits her in the Dominican Republic. But 
this time, on the day when his plane is 
supposed to land, Camino arrives at the airport 
to see crowds of crying people…

YA 
FICTION 
COL

Collins, 
Suzanne,

The Ballad of 
Songbirds and Snakes 

It is the morning of the reaping that will kick off 
the tenth annual Hunger Games. In the Capital, 
eighteen-year-old Coriolanus Snow is preparing 
for his one shot at glory as a mentor in the 
Games.

YA 
FICTION 
GAR Garvin, Jeff,

The Lightness of 
Hands 

About a teen girl with bipolar II who signs her 
failed magician father up to perform his 
legendary but failed illusion on live TV in order 
to make enough money to pay for the 
medications they need

YA 
FICTION 
GRE

Gregorio, I. 
W., 1976-

This is My Brain in 
Love 

It will take everything Will and Jocelyn have and 
more, to save the family restaurant and their 
budding romance. 

YA 
FICTION 
HES

Hesse, 
Monica, They Went Left 

Germany, 1945. The soldiers who liberated the 
Gross-Rosen concentration camp said the war 
was over, but nothing feels over to eighteen-
year-old Zofia Lederman.



YA 
FICTION 
LAW

Lawson, Liz, 
1980- The Lucky Ones 

May is a survivor. But she doesn't feel like one. 
She feels angry. And lost. And alone. Eleven 
months after the school shooting that killed her 
twin brother, May still doesn't know why she 
was the only one to walk out of the band room 
that day. 

YA 
FICTION 
MCS

McSmith, 
Tobly, Stay Gold 

Debut author Tobly McSmith delivers a coming-
of-age teen love story about a transgender boy 
who’s going stealth at his new Texas high 
school and a cisgender girl who is drawn to 
him.

YA 
FICTION 
MYR

Myracle, 
Lauren, 1969- This Boy 

Lauren Myracle lays bare the life of one boy as 
he navigates friendship, love, loss, and 
addiction. It’s life at its most ordinary and most 
unforgettable.

YA 
FICTION 
OLI

Oliver, 
Benjamin, The Loop 

It's Luka Kane's sixteenth birthday and he's 
been inside The Loop for over two years. Every 
inmate is serving a death sentence with the 
option to push back their execution date by six 
months if they opt into "Delays".

GRAPHIC 
YA 
155.937 
FED Feder, Tyler,

Dancing at the Pity 
Party: A dead mom 
graphic memoir. 

Part poignant cancer memoir and part 
humorous reflection on a motherless life, this 
debut graphic novel is extraordinarily 
comforting and engaging.
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