
New Easy Books for March & April 2020

Check the box for the items you would like to request & complete the bottom portion of the form with your information.                                                                                           

EASY AHM
Ahmed, Roda, 
1981- Mae Among the Stars 

Little Mae’s curiosity, intelligence, 
and determination, matched with her 
parents' encouraging words, paved 
the way for her success at NASA as 
the first African American woman to 
travel in space. 

EASY ATI Atinuke, B is For Baby 

One morning after breakfast, Baby's 
big brother is getting ready to take 
the basket of bananas all the way to 
Baba's bungalow in the next village.

EASY BAR Barton, Chris, Fire Truck vs. Dragon 

A silly book about the friendship of a 
dragon and a firetruck and all their 
unexpected talents.

EASY BASKET 
PEP Peppa's Windy Fall Day 

Join Peppa and her family as they 
enjoy outdoor fun in the crisp, 
autumn air in this delightful storybook 
based on the hit show!

EASY BRO

Brown, Margaret 
Wise, 1910-
1952, Two Little Trains 

A picture book about two trains and 
their cross-country journey from east 
to west.

EASY CUY Cuyler, Margery, Bonaparte Plays Ball 

Join a skeleton named Bonaparte 
and his teammates as they compete 
in the Weird Series--a monster 
version of the World Series.

EASY DEN Dennis, Kathryn, Snakes on a Train 

A picture book full of sibilant sounds 
and other word play, Snakes on a 
Train is as fun for parents as it is for 
kids, and sure to be a read-aloud hit.



EASY GAR
Garcia, Emma, 
1969-

Plinka Plinka Shake 
Shake 

This is a music box of a book about 
making joyful noise!  

EASY GOO Goodale, E. B., Under the Lilacs 

Kate feels ignored by her mother and 
sister and so decides to run away. In 
a neighboring yard, she builds a fort 
and enjoys a sense of independence.

EASY LEB Lebeuf, Darren, My Ocean is Blue 

A young girl at the seaside, lyrically 
describes her ocean in simple, 
sensory detail. It's both "slimy" and 
"sandy," "sparkly" and "dull." It has 
wonderful sounds, as it "splashes 
and crashes and echoes and 
squawks."

EASY MEL Meloy, Colin, Everyone's Awake 

Instead of settling down to sleep, Dad 
bakes bread, Mom fixes the roof, and 
Grandma plays cards with a ghost. 

EASY MUR Murray, Diana, Goodnight, Veggies 

Every veggie needs their shut-eye in 
this bedtime book that celebrates 
community, the joys of a small 
garden, and the importance of taking 
care of ourselves.

EASY PRE
Preston-Gannon, 
Frann, By the Light of the Moon 

A little frog is singing to himself in the 
swamp one night. Nothing sounds 
right until they are joined by the 
littlest voice in the swamp -- that of a 
tiny firefly.

EASY THO
Thomas, Isabel, 
1979- Moth 

Evolution story that captures the 
struggle of animal survival against 
the background of an evolving human 
world in a unique and atmospheric 
introduction to Darwin's theory of 
Natural Selection.



EASY VAN
Van Slyke, 
Rebecca, Monster's Trucks 

Monster loves his construction 
vehicles.  But Monster does not like 
sharing his trucks! 
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